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Editorial Review

From the Back Cover
In February of 1995 The Rules was quietly published - and dating has never been the same since! Now here
comes The Rules II, the book every Rules Girl has been waiting for, the book you helped write! Drawing on
the most commonly asked questions from the thousands of letters and calls to The Rules hotline they
received, authors Ellen Fein and Sherrie Schneider show you how to do The Rules in even the most difficult
- and tempting! - situations. Here are new Rules tips for weeding out Mr. Wrong - and sorting out your own
feelings; recognizing when a relationship is really a fantasy; dating a man who is separated; talking to your
therapist - yes, in some cases, you can tell your therapist you're doing The Rules; dating a high-profile man
or a celebrity; dating when you yourself are very wealthy/successful/famous; giving him gifts; getting him to
the altar; and much more, including how The Rules apply to same-sex relationships, older women, on-line
dating, long-distance relationships, getting back an ex, having office romances. How does a Rules Girl
handle a long-distance relationship? An office romance? A weekend invitation from a high-profile man or
celebrity? How do The Rules apply to on-line dating and personal ads? Are The Rules different for mature
women? Can The Rules benefit people in same-sex relationships? Friendships? Family relationships? Can a
Rules Girl date her best buddy if she's attracted to him - rekindle the flame with an ex? The Rules II answers
these questions and more! The sequel to the #1 coast-to-coast bestseller that revolutionized modern dating, it
was written in response to the thousands of letters and telephone calls authors Ellen Fein and Sherrie
Schneiderreceived from readers doing The Rules. Packed with expanded, more detailed do's and don'ts;
encouraging, stick-to-it advice; scores of new tips; and success stories from women like you; it's your latest
guide to the way of life that leads to self-respect, self-esteem, and, most of all, a happy and healthy
marriage...

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Evelyn White:

Throughout other case, little men and women like to read book The Rules II. You can choose the best book if
you love reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book The Rules II. You can add
know-how and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, simply because from
book you can recognize everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will end up
known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, you can open a book
as well as searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel weary to go to
the library. Let's examine.

Kathryn Cortez:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question due
to the fact just their can do in which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
correct. Because start from on guardería until university need this The Rules II to read.



Erin Wright:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
loved ones or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV,
as well as playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different
you can read a book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the
entire day to reading a reserve. The book The Rules II it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of
those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have
enough space to develop this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this
book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book provides high quality.

Maria Holder:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You can
view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended to you
is The Rules II this book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This specific
book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The language styles that writer value to explain
it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why
this book suited all of you.
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