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Editorial Review

From the Back Cover

This volume explores the usefulness of the Asian model of agricultural development for Africa, where, even
before the recent world food crisis, half the population lived on less than on dollar a day, and a staggering
one in three people and one third of all children were undernourished. Africa has abundant natural resources;
agriculture provides most of its jobs, a third of national income and a larger portion of total export earnings.
However the levels of land and labor productivity rank among the worst in the world. The book explains
Africa’s productivity gap and proposes ways to close it, by examining recent experience in Africa and by
drawing on lessons from Asia.

Part I surveys the transferability of Asia’s Green Revolution to Sub-Saharan Africa and explores whether
Africa should focus on staple crops and small farms. Coverage spans technology, irrigation, climate and
agricultural policies in the Asian Green Revolution, and probes whether geography explains why such a
revolution has eluded Africa.

Part II discusses two crops which have been considered highly promising, and addresses the issue of low-
input vs. high-input agriculture. The authors explore NERICA, a variety of upland rice developed for Africa,
and the challenges of establishing a chain of production that improves agriculture and reduces hunger. The
section also details the adoption of high-yielding maize varieties throughout Africa, citing case studies on the
possibilities of maize Green Revolutions in Kenya and Uganda.

Addressing the poor quality of Africa’s soils and the limited reach of fertilizer markets, Part III shows how
markets shape farmer incentives and fertilizer demand and discusses the role of governments in achieving
substantial productivity growth.

A recurring theme of the book is that while a handful of innovations in rice and wheat helped bring about
large and sweeping changes for farmers and the urban poor in Asia, a broader set of innovations are needed
to launch Africa’s Green Revolution. It is the editors’ belief that the conditions for success in Africa are
growing rather than diminishing and that the seeds for Africa’s Green Revolution have been sown.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Juan Farley:

The book An African Green Revolution: Finding Ways to Boost Productivity on Small Farms gives you the
sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable far more increase. Book can
being your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem with the subject. If you can make
reading a book An African Green Revolution: Finding Ways to Boost Productivity on Small Farms to be
your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your
knowledge about several or all subjects. You could know everything if you like open up and read a reserve
An African Green Revolution: Finding Ways to Boost Productivity on Small Farms. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this
book?



Olivia Cook:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or
something that they don't would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book An
African Green Revolution: Finding Ways to Boost Productivity on Small Farms. All type of book would you
see on many solutions. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Sophia Morrison:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping An African Green
Revolution: Finding Ways to Boost Productivity on Small Farms that give your entertainment preference
will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the way for
people to know world considerably better then how they react to the world. It can't be stated constantly that
reading routine only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to always be success person.
So , for every you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you are able to pick An African Green
Revolution: Finding Ways to Boost Productivity on Small Farms become your current starter.

George McDaniel:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you know
that little person such as reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something by book. Amount
types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually An African Green
Revolution: Finding Ways to Boost Productivity on Small Farms.
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