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Editorial Review

Amazon.com Review
Book Description

Join New York Times bestselling author and Food Network star Guy Fieri for a second helping
of the best diners, drive-ins, and dives across America!

Guy Fieri strikes again with More Diners, Drive-ins and Dives, giving you a road map to road food that's
earned its culinary citizenship in "Flavortown." Join Guy on a cross-country noshing parade, mapping out the
best places you've never heard of—more than fifty establishments off the beaten path. Compete in a (no
hands) apple-pie-eating contest at Bobo Drive-In in Topeka, Kansas, dip your taste buds in Sweet Spicy
Love sauce at Uncle Lou's Fried Chicken in Memphis, Tennessee, and get a load of the killer four-cheese
mac-and-cheese at Gorilla Barbeque in Pacifica, California. Filled with Guy's hilarious voice and rampant
enthusiasm for these hidden culinary gems, More Diners, Drive-ins and Dives is the perfect book for lovers
of the American food scene and fans of Triple D.

Pleasure Cruising Through More Diners, Drive-ins and Dives by Guy Fieri

Dear Amazon Customers,

My drop-top culinary cruise to America’s most fun and funkiest joints is the adventure we’re all looking for-
-and I’m having the time of my life. I’m glad to get out there because it reminds me of what a great country
we have. I have five restaurants of my own (three Johnny Garlic’s and two Tex Wasabi’s), and as a chef and
restaurant owner, let me tell you, it’s a tough business. You really have to love it to keep with it. I thought
having my own restaurants in Northern California’s wine country couldn’t be beat, but sharing these mom
and pop joints across the country and highlighting not just their food but their stories is probably the greatest
experience I’ve ever had. And on top of it all, the show results in an increase in their business and ends up



changing their lives. We get stories emailed to us all the time: I opened a second location, I bought the
building, I bought my wife a new Mercedes.

One of these folks was Gorilla Rich, owner of Gorilla Barbeque in Pacifica, California. I met him while at a
NASCAR race, and I knew this guy had to be on television. I didn’t even know he had a barbeque restaurant
at the time, so I wasn’t even thinking of Diners, Drive-ins and Dives. I even called my producer from the
track and said, “I met this dude and we’ve got to get him on television.” Long story short, turns out he’s
doing some slammin’ BBQ, we end up highlighting his restaurant on the show, and things are blown out!
They’ve got a second smoker now and are looking into another location. Gorilla and I have become really
good buddies, so when I’m home in California he’ll drive up to my house and we’ll hang out. Making these
connections is one of the neatest things about doing the show. It can’t happen with all of them, of course, but
at some of the locations--like Voula’s, Panini Pete’s, Grinders, Luigi’s Pizzeria, and Hodad’s--these people
have become really close friends. And it’s not that we’re great friends because I came to shine a light on
them and change opportunities for their business, it’s because they’re brothers from another mother. We’re
all in this industry to make people happy, that’s what we love to do. So when you find these other brothers
that are out there doing that same thing, it’s a culinary family reunion in flavortown.

Review
#1 New York Times Bestseller (New York Times)

#7 Washington Post Bestseller (Washington Post)

About the Author

Guy Fieri is the culinary rock star of Food Network, hosting the top-rated Diners, Drive-Ins and Dives, Guy's
Grocery Games, Guy's Big Bite, and Rachael vs. Guy Celebrity Cook-Off. His four books—Diners, Drive-Ins
and Dives; More Diners, Drive-Ins and Dives; Diners, Drive-Ins, and Dives: The Funky Finds in
Flavortown; and Guy Fieri Food—were major New York Times bestsellers. Guy is the co-owner of Johnny
Garlic's California Pasta Grill, Tex Wasabi's, Guy's American Kitchen and Bar, Guy's Burger Joint, and
GFOC (Guy Fieri on Campus). He lives in Northern California with his wife, Lori, and their two boys,
Hunter and Ryder.

Ann Volkwein is a food and lifestyle writer based in New York City and Austin, Texas, who also
collaborated with Guy on his four previous books.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Ismael Black:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important issue to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book More Diners, Drive-ins and Dives: A
Drop-Top Culinary Cruise Through America's Finest and Funkiest Joints will make you to end up being
smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think this
open or reading the book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have



you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Kathryn Sheffield:

Reading a book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their particular reader with
their story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about
the information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always
try to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of
them is this More Diners, Drive-ins and Dives: A Drop-Top Culinary Cruise Through America's Finest and
Funkiest Joints.

Thelma Martin:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
had been exactly added. This book More Diners, Drive-ins and Dives: A Drop-Top Culinary Cruise Through
America's Finest and Funkiest Joints was filled regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your
knowledge about your science competence. Some people has several feel when they reading some sort of
book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era
like today, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Jerry Ingle:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but in addition
native or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world.
Through the book More Diners, Drive-ins and Dives: A Drop-Top Culinary Cruise Through America's
Finest and Funkiest Joints we can get more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? Being creative
person must prefer to read a book. Only choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't be doubt to
change your life with this book More Diners, Drive-ins and Dives: A Drop-Top Culinary Cruise Through
America's Finest and Funkiest Joints. You can more pleasing than now.
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